Message

From: MecLaughlin, Cindy [McLaughlin, Cindy ]

Sent: 2/3/2011 7:06:23 PM

To: Richie-Anderson, Donna ; Morefield, Elizabeth J
CC: Elsbernd, Brian D; Rago, Jlay M; Kim, Jackie
Subject: Request for Status of Payment for Maine DO grant

Attachments: Grant Compliance Requests to be Processed for Payment Please.pdf; Maine Osteopathic Society S10K.pdf

Liz and Donna,

Please see 1st attachment that is an email from me dated Dec. 9 to Liz re: the need for payment ($10,000)
to the Maine Osteopathic Society. The 2nd attachment is background on the grant request.

Can either of you tell me the status of payment please?

Thank you,
Cindy

————— original Message-----

From: Elsbernd, Brian D

Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 10:33 AM
To: Rage, Jay M

Cc: McLaughlin, Cindy

Subject: RE: Maine DO grant

Jay,

I believe that this is in the payment queue. I have cc'd Cindy McLaughlin to confirm.
————— original Message-----

From: Rago, Jay M

Sent: Monday, January 31, 2011 12:49 PM

To: Elsbernd, Brian D

Subject: Maine DO grant

Hi Brian,

The Maine DO conference organizers are asking us about the unrestricted grant we are supporting. You
mentioned it was approved. They haven't gotten the check yet. Any update? Thanks

Jay Rage
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